D.R. 2/2004

RANG UNDANG-UNDANG

bernama

Suatu Akta untuk meminda Akta Pemegang Amanah (Pemerbadanan)
1952.

DIPERBUAT oleh Parlimen Malaysia seperti yang berikut:

Tajuk ringkas dan permulaan kuat kuasa

1. (1) Akta ini bolehlah dinamakan Akta Pemegang Amanah
(Pemerbadanan) (Pindaan) 2004.

(2) Akta ini mula berkuat kuasa pada tarikh yang ditetapkan
oleh Menteri melalui pemberitahuan dalam Warta.

Pindaan seksyen 1

2. Akta Pemegang Amanah (Pemerbadanan) 1952 [Akta 258], yang
disebut "Akta ibu" dalam Akta ini, dipinda dalam seksyen 1 —

(a) dalam nota bahu, dengan memotong perkataan
" definition";

(b) dalam subseksyen (2), dengan menggantikan perkataan
"West" dengan perkataan "Peninsular”; dan

(c) dengan memotong subseksyen (3).



2 Rang Undang-Undang
Pindaan am

3. Akta ibu dipinda dengan menggantikan perkataan "corporate
body" di mana-mana jua terdapat dengan perkataan "body corporate”.

Seksyen baru 1A

4. Akta ibu dipinda dengan memasukkan selepas seksyen 1 seksyen
yang berikut:

"Interpretation
1A. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires —
"certificate of incorporation” means the certificate of

registration of a trustee or trustees as a body corporate that
may be granted under section 2.".

Pindaan seksyen 4

5. Seksyen 4 Akta ibu dipinda dengan memasukkan selepas
subseksyen (2) subseksyen yang berikut:

"(3) The Minister may refuse to grant a certificate of
incorporation under this Act if he is not satisfied that the application

has complied with the provisions of this Act or the regulations
made under this Act."”.

Pindaan seksyen 5

6. Seksyen 5 Akta ibu dipinda dalam subseksyen (2) dengan
menggantikan perkataan "five years" dengan perkataan "one year".

Seksyen baru 6A

7. Akta ibu dipinda dengan memasukkan selepas seksyen 6 seksyen
yang berikut:

"Disqualification of trustees

6A. Where a certificate of incorporation has been granted
under this Act in respect of a trustee or trustees, a person shall



Pemegang Amanah (Pemerbadanan) (Pindaan) 3

be disqualified from being, and shall not become or remain,

such

(@)

(b)

©)
(d)

Pindaan

trustee or one of such trustees if—

he has been convicted of any offence under any law and
sentenced to a fine of not less than one thousand ringgit
or to imprisonment for a term of not less than one year
or to both;

there has been made and is in force against him any
order of detention, supervision, restricted residence,
banishment or deportation, or if there has been imposed
on him any form of restriction or supervision, by bond
or otherwise, under any law relating to the security of
Malaysia or any part thereof, the prevention of crime,
preventive detention, restricted residence, banishment
or immigration;

he is an undischarged bankrupt; or

he is, or has been found or declared to be, of unsound
mind.".

seksyen 7

8. Seksyen 7 Akta ibu dipinda dengan memasukkan selepas

perkataan

Pindaan

"so granted shall™ perkataan "until and unless it is revoked".

seksyen 10

9. Seksyen 10 Akta ibu dipinda dengan menggantikan perkataan
"ten" dengan perkataan "thirty".

Pindaan

seksyen 15

10. Seksyen 15 Akta ibu dipinda—

(@)

(b)

dalam subseksyen (2), dengan menggantikan perkataan
"25th day of March" dengan perkataan "30th day of
June™; dan

dalam subseksyen (2), (3) dan (4), dengan menggantikan
perkataan "Attorney General” di mana-mana jua terdapat
dengan perkataan "Minister".



4

Rang Undang-Undang

Seksyen baru 17, 18, 19, 20 dan 21

11. Akta ibu dipinda dengan memasukkan selepas seksyen 16
seksyen yang berikut:

""Revocation or suspension of certificate of incorporation

17. (1) The Minister may by order revoke the certificate of
incorporation if—

(@)

(b)

©

(d)

€)

the incorporation was effected as a result of fraud or
mistake or misrepresentation in any material particular;

the body or association of persons by whom the trustee
or trustees constituting the body corporate are appointed
is likely to be used for unlawful purposes or purposes
prejudicial to or incompatible with the security of
Malaysia or public order or morality in Malaysia or
any part thereof;

the body or association of persons by whom the trustee
or trustees constituting the body corporate are appointed
is found to have pursued objectives other than those
for which it was originally established,;

the body corporate has wilfully contravened any
provision of this Act or any regulations made under
this Act; or

if the body corporate does any act or omits to do any
act the doing or omission of which is an offence
under any law and punishable with a fine of not less
than one thousand ringgit or with imprisonment for
a term of not less than one year or to both.

(2) The Minister shall notify the body corporate of his
intention to revoke the certificate of incorporation of the
body corporate.

(3) No certificate of incorporation shall be revoked under
this section without the body corporate being given the
opportunity to show cause in writing within a period of
thirty days from the date of receipt of a notice to show cause
as to why the certificate should not be revoked.



Pemegang Amanah (Pemerbadanan) (Pindaan) 5

(4) During the period specified in subsection (3), the Minister
may by order in writing suspend all or any of the activities
of the body corporate —

(@) in order to restrain the body corporate from further
infringing or violating any provision of this Act or
any regulations made under this Act; or

(b) if he thinks it is necessary to do so in the interest of
the public or of the body corporate or the body or
association of persons by whom the trustee or trustees
constituting the body corporate are appointed.

(5) An order made under subsection (4) may contain such
conditions as the Minister thinks necessary or expedient and
shall continue to be in force until the order or the certificate
of incorporation is revoked.

(6) The revocation of the certificate of registration of any
body corporate by the Minister under this section shall come
into force on the date the notification of such revocation is
communicated to the trustee, or if there is more than one
trustee, at least one of the trustees, and it shall be final and
conclusive.

Voluntary dissolution of body corporate

18. (1) A body corporate may be dissolved voluntarily in
either of the following ways:

(@) upon the happening of any event as specified in the
trust deed which amounts to the dissolution of the
body corporate; or

(b) by the decision of the trustee, or if there is more than
one trustee, the unanimous agreement of the trustees,
testified by the trustee or trustees constituting the
body corporate signing an instrument of dissolution
and with the consent of the body or association of
persons by whom the trustee or trustees are appointed.

(2) The trustee or trustees shall immediately inform the
Minister of the happening of the event referred to in paragraph
()(a) or the decision or agreement referred to in paragraph

(D().



Rang Undang-Undang

(3) The Minister shall make an order revoking the certificate
of incorporation as from such date as is specified in the
order.

Consequences of revocation of certificate of incorporation

19. (1) Upon an order being made under subsection 17(1)
or 18(3)-

(a) the body corporate is dissolved;

(b) any assets or liabilities of the body or association of
persons vested in the body corporate shall vest in
such trustee or trustees as may be appointed by the
body or association of persons, or if the trustee or
trustees are the same trustee or trustees who had been
incorporated as the body corporate before its dissolution,
in such trustee or trustees, in trust for such body or
association; and

(c) any legal proceeding that might have been continued
or instituted by or against the body corporate with
respect to any asset or liability vested in the body
corporate may be continued or instituted by or against
the trustee or trustees in whom the asset or liability
is vested subsequent to the dissolution.

(2) Notwithstanding subsection (1),in the absence of such
trustee or trustees as are referred to in subsection (1) any
property vested in such body corporate shall vest in the
Amanah Raya Berhad, a body corporate established under
the Public Trust Corporation Act 1995 [Act 532], in trust for
the body or association of persons by whom the trustee or
trustees who had been incorporated as the body corporate
before its dissolution was appointed, until the appointment
by the body or association of persons of a new trustee or
trustees; and upon such appointment the property shall be
transferred to and vest in such trustee or trustees.

Appointment of Registrar, Deputy Registrars and Assistant
Registrars

20. (1) The Minister may appoint a Registrar and such number
of Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars as he may
consider necessary for the purposes of this Act.



Pemegang Amanah (Pemerbadanan) (Pindaan) 7

(2) The Registrar, Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars
shall perform such functions as may be specified by the
Minister in writing for the purpose of giving effect to and
carrying out the provisions of this Act.

(3) The Registrar, Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars
shall be deemed to be public servants for the purposes of the
Penal Code [Act 574].

(4) Nothing done or omitted to be done by the Registrar,
Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars shall, if done or
omitted to be done in good faith for the purpose of executing
the provisions of this Act, subject any of them to any action,
liability, claim or demand.

Regulations

21. (1) The Minister may make such regulations as are
necessary or expedient to give full effect to or for carrying
out the provisions of this Act.

(2) In particular and without prejudice to the generality
of subsection (1), regulations may be made for prescribing—

(@) the manner of making applications to register a trustee
or trustees as a body corporate;

(b) the procedure to be followed in registering a trustee
or trustees as a body corporate;

(c) the information to be furnished to the Minister; and

(d) the fees which can be imposed and collected for the
purposes of this Act.".

HURAIAN

Rang Undang-Undang ini bertujuan untuk meminda Akta Pemegang Amanah
(Pemerbadanan) 1952 ("Akta 258").

2. Fasal 1 mengandungi tajuk ringkas dan peruntukan tentang permulaan kuat
kuasa Akta yang dicadangkan.



8 Rang Undang-Undang

3. Fasal 5 bertujuan untuk mcmasukkan subseksyen baru (3) ke dalam seksyen 4

Akta 258 untuk memberi Menteri kuasa untuk cnggan memberikan suatu perakuan
Pemerbadanan jika permohonan bagi perakuan itu tidak mematuhi peruntukan Akta itu

atau peraturan-peraturan yang dibuat di bawah Akta itu.

4. Fasal 6 bertujuan untuk meminda subseksyen 5(2) Akta 258 untuk
memendekkan tempob pengemukaan penyata kepada Menteri oleh pemegang
amanah yang telah didaftarkan sebagai suatu pertubuhan perbadanan (“pertubuhan
perbadanan").

5. Fasal 7 bertujuan untuk memasukkan seksyen baru 6A ke dalam Akta 258
untuk mengadakan peruntukan bagi kehilangan kelayakan pemegang amanah
yang telah didaftarkan di bawah Akta itu.

6. Fasal 8 bertujuan untuk meminda seksyen 7 Akta 258 supaya perakuan
Pemerbadanan menjadi keterangan konklusif tentang Pemerbadanan scsuatu
pertubuhan perbadanan selagi perakuan itu tidak dibatalkan.

7. Fasal 9 bertujuan untuk meminda seksyen 10 Akta 258 untuk menaikkan
duti setem yang kena dibayar bagi sesuatu permohonan bagi perakuan Pemerbadanan
dan perakuan itu daripada RM10.00 kepada RM30.00.

8. Fasal 10 bertujuan untuk meminda seksyen 15 Akta 258 bagi menghendaki
akaun tahunan sesuatu pertubuhan perbadanan dikemukakan kepada Menteri,
dan tidak kepada Peguam Negara. Akaun itu hendaklah dikemukakan scbclum
30 Jun dan tidak 25 Mac setiap tahun.

9. Fasal 11 bertujuan untuk memasukkan seksyen baru 17,18 dan 19 ke dalam

Akta 258. Peruntukan ini mengandungi perkara-perkara mengenai pembatalan
perakuan Pemerbadanan sesuatu pertubuhan perbadanan, pembubaran sukarela
sesuatu pertubuhan perbadanan dan akibat daripada pembatalan dan pembubaran

itu. Fasal ini juga bertujuan untuk memasukkan seksyen baru 20 untuk

membolehkan Menteri melantik Pendaftar, Timbalan Pendaftar dan Penolong

Pendaftar bagi maksud membantunya dalam melaksanakan peruntukan Akta itu
dan seksyen baru 21 yang bertujuan untuk memberi Menteri kuasa untuk membuat
peraturan-peraturan bagi maksud memberi kuat kuasa penuh kepada peruntukan

Akta itu.

10. Pindaan-pindaan lain yang tidak disebut secara khusus dalam Huraian ini
merupakan pindaan yang kecil atau berbangkit.

IMPLIKASI KEWANGAN

Rang Undang-Undang ini akan melibatkan Kerajaan dalam perbelanjaan wang
tambahan yang amaunnya belum dapat ditentukan sekarang ini.

[PN(U?2324]



A BILL

intituled

An Act to amend the Trustees (Incorporation) Act 1952.

ENACTED by the Parliament of Malaysia as follows:

Short title and commencement

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Trustees (Incorporation)
(Amendment) Act 2004.

(2) This Act comes into operation on a date to be appointed by
the Minister by notification in the Gazette.

Amendment of section 1

2. The Trustees (Incorporation) Act 1952 [Act 258], which is
referred to in this Act as the "principal Act", is amended in
section 1 —

(@) in the shoulder note, by deleting the words ", definition";

(b) in subsection (2), by substituting for the word "West" the
word "Peninsular™; and

(c) by deleting subsection (3).



2 Bill
General amendment

3. The principal Act is amended by substituting for the words
"corporate body" wherever appearing the words "body corporate”.

New section 1A

4. The principal Act is amended by inserting after section 1 the
following section:

"Interpretation

1A. In this Act, unless the context otherwise requires —

"certificate of incorporation” means the certificate of
registration of a trustee or trustees as a body corporate that
may be granted under section 2.".

Amendment of section 4

5. Section 4 of the principal Act is amended by inserting after
subsection (2) the following subsection:

"(3) The Minister may refuse to grant a certificate of
incorporation under this Act if he is not satisfied that the application
has complied with the provisions of this Act or the regulations
made under this Act.".

Amendment of section 5

6. Section 5 of the principal Act is amended in subsection (2) by
substituting for the words "five years" the words "one year".

New section 6A

7. The principal Act is amended by inserting after section 6 the
following section:

"Disqualification of trustees

6A. Where a certificate of incorporation has been granted
under this Act in respect of a trustee or trustees, a person shall



Trustees (Incorporation) (Amendment) 3

be disqualified from being, and shall not become or remain,
such trustee or one of such trustees if—

(@)

(b)

(©
(d)

he has been convicted of any offence under any law
and sentenced to a fine of not less than one thousand
ringgit or to imprisonment for a term of not less than
one year or to both;

there has been made and is in force against him any
order of detention, supervision, restricted residence,
banishment or deportation, or if there has been imposed
on him any form of restriction or supervision, by bond
or otherwise, under any law relating to the security of
Malaysia or any part thereof, the prevention of crime,
preventive detention, restricted residence, banishment
or immigration;

he is an undischarged bankrupt; or

he is, or has been found or declared to be, of unsound
mind.".

Amendment of section 7

8. Section 7 of the principal Act is amended by inserting after the
words "so granted shall” the words "until and unless it is revoked".

Amendment of section 10

9. Section 10 of the principal Act is amended by substituting for
the word "ten" the word "thirty".

Amendment of section 15

10. Section 15 of the principal Act is amended—

(@) in subsection (2), by substituting for the words "25th day
of March" the words "30th day of June"; and

(b) in subsections (2), (3) and (4), by substituting for the
words "Attorney General” wherever appearing the word
"Minister".



4

Bill

New sections 17, 18, 19, 20 and 21

11. The principal Act is amended by inserting after section 16 the
following sections:

""Revocation or suspension of certificate of incorporation

17. (1) The Minister may by order revoke the certificate of
incorporation if—

(@)

(b)

©

(d)

©)

the incorporation was effected as a result of fraud or
mistake or misrepresentation in any material particular;

the body or association of persons by whom the trustee
or trustees constituting the body corporate are appointed
is likely to be used for unlawful purposes or purposes
prejudicial to or incompatible with the security of
Malaysia or public order or morality in Malaysia or
any part thereof;

the body or association of persons by whom the trustee
or trustees constituting the body corporate are appointed
is found to have pursued objectives other than those

for which it was originally established;

the body corporate has wilfully contravened any
provision of this Act or any regulations made under
this Act; or

if the body corporate does any act or omits to do any
act the doing or omission of which is an offence
under any law and punishable with a fine of not less
than one thousand ringgit or with imprisonment for
a term of not less than one year or to both.

(2) The Minister shall notify the body corporate of his
intention to revoke the certificate of incorporation of the
body corporate.

(3) No certificate of incorporation shall be revoked under
this section without the body corporate being given the
opportunity to show cause in writing within a period of
thirty days from the date of receipt of a notice to show cause
as to why the certificate should not be revoked.



Trustees (Incorporation) (Amendment) 5

(4) During the period specified in subsection (3), the Minister
may by order in writing suspend all or any of the activities
of the body corporate —

(@) in order to restrain the body corporate from further
infringing or violating any provision of this Act or
any regulations made under this Act; or

(b) if he thinks it is necessary to do so in the interest of
the public or of the body corporate or the body or
association of persons by whom the trustee or trustees
constituting the body corporate are appointed.

(5) An order made under subsection (4) may contain such
conditions as the Minister thinks necessary or expedient and
shall continue to be in force until the order or the certificate
of incorporation is revoked.

(6) The revocation of the certificate of registration of any
body corporate by the Minister under this section shall come
into force on the date the notification of such revocation is
communicated to the trustee, or if there is more than one
trustee, at least one of the trustees, and it shall be final and
conclusive.

Voluntary dissolution of body corporate

18. (1) A body corporate may be dissolved voluntarily in
either of the following ways:

(@) upon the happening of any event as specified in the
trust deed which amounts to the dissolution of the
body corporate; or

(b) by the decision of the trustee, or if there is more than
one trustee, the unanimous agreement of the trustees,
testified by the trustee or trustees constituting the
body corporate signing an instrument of dissolution
and with the consent of the body or association of
persons by whom the trustee or trustees are appointed.

(2) The trustee or trustees shall immediately inform the
Minister of the happening of the event referred to in
paragraph (1}(a) or the decision or agreement referred to in

paragraph (1)(b).



Bill

(3) The Minister shall make an order revoking the certificate
of incorporation as from such date as is specified in the
order.

Consequences of revocation of certificate of incorporation

19. (1) Upon an order being made under subsection 17(1)
or 18(3)-

(@) the body corporate is dissolved:

(b) any assets or liabilities of the body or association of
persons vested in the body corporate shall vest in
such trustee or trustees as may be appointed by the
body or association of persons, or if the trustee or
trustees are the same trustee or trustees who had been
incorporated as the body corporate before its dissolution,
in such trustee or trustees, in trust for such body or
association; and

(c) any legal proceeding that might have been continued
or instituted by or against the body corporate with
respect to any asset or liability vested in the body
corporate may be continued or instituted by or against
the trustee or trustees in whom the asset or liability
is vested subsequent to the dissolution.

(2) Notwithstanding subsection (1), in the absence of such
trustee or trustees as are referred to in subsection (1) any
property vested in such body corporate shall vest in the
Amanah Raya Berhad, a body corporate established under
the Public Trust Corporation Act 1995 [Act 532], in trust for
the body or association of persons by whom the trustee or
trustees who had been incorporated as the body corporate
before its dissolution was appointed, until the appointment
by the body or association of persons of a new trustee or
trustees; and upon such appointment the property shall be
transferred to and vest in such trustee or trustees.

Appointment of Registrar, Deputy Registrars and Assistant
Registrars

20. (1) The Minister may appoint a Registrar and such number
of Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars as he may
consider necessary for the purposes of this Act.



Trustees (Incorporation) (Amendment) 7

(2) The Registrar, Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars
shall perform such functions as may be specified by the
Minister in writing for the purpose of giving effect to and
carrying out the provisions of this Act.

(3) The Registrar, Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars
shall be deemed to be public servants for the purposes of the
Penal Code [Act 574].

(4) Nothing done or omitted to be done by the Registrar,
Deputy Registrars and Assistant Registrars shall, if done or
omitted to be done in good faith for the purpose of executing
the provisions of this Act, subject any of them to any action,
liability, claim or demand.

Regulations

21. (1) The Minister may make such regulations as are
necessary or expedient to give full effect to or for carrying
out the provisions of this Act.

(2) In particular and without prejudice to the generality
of subsection (1), regulations may be made for prescribing —

(a) the manner of making applications to register a trustee
or trustees as a body corporate;

(b) the procedure to be followed in registering a trustee
or trustees as a body corporate;

(c) the information to be furnished to the Minister; and

(d) the fees which can be imposed and collected for the
purposes of this Act.".

EXPLANATORY STATEMENT
This Bill seeks to amend the Trustees (Incorporation) Act 1952 ("Act 258").

2. Clause | contains the short title and provisions on the commencement of
the proposed Act.



8 Bill

3. Clause 5 seeks to introduce a new subsection (3) into section 4 of Act 258
to empower the Minister to refuse to grant a certificate of incorporation if the
application for such certificate does not comply with the provisions of the Act
or regulations made under the Act.

4. Clause 6 seeks to amend subsection 5(2) of Act 258 to shorten the period
for the submission of returns to the Minister by the trustees who have been
registered as a body corporate ("body corporate").

5. Clause 7 seeks to introduce a new section 6A into Act 258 to provide for
the disqualification of trustees who have been registered under the Act.

6. Clause 8 seeks to amend section 7 of Act 258 so that a certificate of
incorporation is conclusive evidence of the incorporation of a body corporate
so long as the certificate is not revoked.

7. Clause 9 seeks to amend section 10 of the Act 258 to increase the stamp
duty payable for an application for a certificate of incorporation and the certificate
from RM 10.00 to RM30.00.

8. Clause 10 seeks to amend section 15 of Act 258 to require the annual
accounts of a body corporate to be submitted to the Minister, instead of the
Attorney General. The accounts will have to be submitted before 30 June
instead of 25 March in each year.

9. Clause 11 seeks to introduce new sections 17, 18 and 19 into Act 258. They
contain matters on the revocation of the certificate of incorporation of a body
corporate, the voluntary dissolution of a body corporate, and the consequences
of such revocation and dissolution. This clause also seeks to introduce a new
section 20 to enable the Minister to appoint the Registrar, Deputy Registrars
and Assistant Registrars for the purpose of assisting him in carrying out the
provisions of the Act and a new section 21 which seeks to empower the Minister
to make regulations for the purpose of giving full effect to the provisions of
the Act.

10.  Other amendments not specifically dealt with in this Statement are minor
or consequential in nature.
FINANCIAL IMPLICATIONS

This Bill will involve the Government in extra financial expenditure the amount
of which cannot at present be ascertained.

[PN(U?2324]



